
 
Name of the Tool 
 

  
 International Bibliography of Art 
 

 
Home Page 

 

 

 
 

 
Logo 

 

 
 

 
URL 

  
http://www.proquest.com/products-services/iba.html 
 

 
Subject  

  
Arts - Bibliography  
 

 
Accessibility 

  
On subscription basis 
 

 
Language 

 
English 
 

 
Publisher 
 

 
ProQuest  

 
Brief History 
 

 
International Bibliography of Art is the successor to the Bibliography of the 
History of Art (BHA). The International Bibliography of Art is the successor 
to the Bibliography of the History of Art and includes the most recent index 
records that were created by the Getty Research Institute as part of BHA. 
These records were created in 2008-2009. ProQuest will be building on this 
by adding 25,000 new records per year going forwards, ensuring unbroken 



coverage of it. 
 

 
Scope and Coverage 

 
International Bibliography of Art covers various aspects of international art. 
It covers European art from late antiquity to the present, American art from 
the colonial era to the present. Visual arts in all media like painting, 
sculpture, drawing, video, installations, new media, decorative and applied 
arts, museum studies and conservation, archaeology, folk art and material 
culture, classical studies, antiques, architectural history also included here. It 
covers different types of documents like journal, monographs, essay 
collections, conference proceedings and exhibition catalogues. 
 

 
Kind of Information 

 
The main entry contains usual bibliographic details. Each entry contains 
name of the author, title, publication and publisher details, year, document 
type, language, subject etc. It also contains document URL. An example is 
given below for clear understanding.  
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Detail information on this title is 
given below. Full text link  



 

 
 

 
 
Special Features 

 
   

 ProQuest offers best-in-class customer service, technical support, and 
training. 
 

 It provides blog. 
 

 It provides other related products like social science collection, social 
science database, and socio-logical abstracts. 
 

 Links to various social networking like Facebook, Twitter, Google+ 
etc. 
 
 

 
Arrangement Pattern 

 
The main subjects are arranged in alphabetical order. Through the subject 
one can browse their require information. Example through screen shot is 
given below. 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

 
  
 

 
Remarks 

 
International Bibliography of Art covers various aspects of international art. 
It is ideal for academic and specialist art libraries, museums, and design 
firms.   
 

 
Comparable Tools 

 
 Cambridge Bibliography of English Literature  

(http://www.oxfordreference.com/view/10.1093/oi/authority.2011080
3095544230?rskey=5tSzON&result=2) 
 

 Asian Canadian Art And Artists Bibliography (http://artexte.ca/wp-
content/uploads/Asian-Canadian-Artists-Bibliography.pdf) 

 
 
Date of Access 
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