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Brief History 
 

 

Annual Review of Cyber Therapy and Telemedicine (ARCTT – ISSN: 1554-8716) 
is one of the official journals of the International Association of Cyber Psychology, 
Training, and Rehabilitation (iACToR). ARGG continues its long tradition of 
professionalism under the editorship of a leading expert in the field of gerontology, 
Toni C. Antonucci. Over the past 35 years, ARGG has brought together 
internationally recognized experts in the fields of gerontology and geriatrics, and 



continues to deliver the highest standards of content and authoritative reviews of 
research for students, researchers, and clinicians. 

 
Scope and Coverage 

 
ARCTT is a peer-reviewed all-purpose journal covering a wide variety of topics of 
interest to the mental health, neuroscience, and rehabilitation communities. The 
mission of ARCTT is to provide systematic, periodic examinations of scholarly 
advances in the field of Cyber Therapy and Telemedicine through original 
investigations in the telemedicine and cyber therapy areas, novel experimental 
clinical studies, and critical authoritative reviews.   

 
Kind of Information 

 

 
Through ARCTT, the researcher or the users can read the volume (full text) and 
download it (PDF) from SCRIBD, ISSUU. Even They can order the paper version 
for University/Department Library & directly on Amazon.com. Each volume of 
ARCTT holds editors introduction, critical review, evaluation studies, original 
research, & critical observation.  
 

 
In this Review, there is guidance for manuscript preparation, proposal of manuscript 
and the submission’s rules are given for those people who want to submit a 
manuscript for reviewing. Annual Review papers examine either novel therapeutic 
methods and trials or a specific clinical application in depth, they are written by 
experienced researchers upon invitation from their Editorial Board. 
 

 
Special Features 

 
It can be accessed from DOAJ. 

 
Arrangement Pattern 

 
   It is arranged volume wise and then non-chronological order is maintained. 
 

 
 
 



 

  

 

 
 
 
Remarks 

 

ARCTT is directed to healthcare providers and researchers who are interested in the 
applications of advanced media for improving the delivery and efficacy of mental 
healthcare and rehabilitative services. 
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 Annual Review ( http://www.annualreviews.org/) 

 
Date of Access 

 
23rd  December, 2016 


